
Page 1 of 3 

CHAPTER 23.65  LOCAL AMENDMENT TO THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL 
EXISTING BUILDING CODE 

Sections 
 
23.65.100 Local amendments to the International Existing Building Code, 

2006 edition .................................................................................... 1 
23.65.101.5.2 Work area compliance method........................................................ 1 
23.65.103-117 Delete sections ................................................................................ 1 
23.65.302.2 Structural......................................................................................... 1 
23.65.303.2.3.2 Alterations....................................................................................... 1 
23.65.305.4 Structural......................................................................................... 2 
23.65.307 Moved structures............................................................................. 2 
23.65.606 Structural......................................................................................... 2 
23.65.704.2 Automatic sprinkler systems........................................................... 2 
23.65.705.4.4 Panic hardware................................................................................ 2 
23.65.707 Structural......................................................................................... 2 
23.65.807 Structural......................................................................................... 2 
23.65.907 Structural......................................................................................... 2 
23.65.1003 Structural......................................................................................... 2 
23.65.1202.3 Wind loads ...................................................................................... 3 
23.65.1202.4 Seismic loads .................................................................................. 3 
23.65.1202.5 Snow loads ...................................................................................... 3 
23.65.1301.4.1 Structural analysis........................................................................... 3 
23.65 Appendix A ..................................................................................... 3 

 
23.65.100 Local amendments to the International Existing Building Code, 

2006 edition 
The amendments to the 2006 Edition of the International Existing Building Code are 
listed hereafter by section. The last digits of the number (after the title and chapter digits) 
are the sections of the International Existing Building Code to which the amendments 
refer. 
 
23.65.101.5.2  Work area compliance method 
Add the following to the end of the paragraph: 
 

Where structural provisions have been deleted by amendment from chapters 6, 7, 
8, 9, and 10, compliance shall be to the structural provisions of chapter 3. 

 
23.65.103-117  Delete sections 
Delete IEBC sections 103 through 117. Refer to the Anchorage Administrative Code 
 
23.65.302.2  Structural 
In the first paragraph, revise “5 percent” to read “10 percent”. 
 
23.65.303.2.3.2 Alterations 
Revise “5 percent” to read “10 percent”. 



Page 2 of 3 

 
23.65.305.4  Structural 
Replace the first paragraph to read as follows: 

 
When a change of occupancy results in a higher seismic occupancy factor based on Table 
1604.5 of the International Building Code; or where such change of occupancy results in 
a reclassification of a building to a higher hazard category as shown in Table 912.4, the 
building shall conform to the seismic requirements of the International Building Code for 
the new seismic use group. 

 
Add a new paragraph after the Exceptions to read as follows: 

 
Buildings or portions thereof subject to a change of occupancy where such change in the 
nature of occupancy results in higher uniform or concentrated loads based on Tables 
1607.1 and 1607.6 of the International Building Code shall comply with the gravity load 
provisions of the International Building Code. 

 
Exception: Structural elements whose stress is not increased by more than 10 percent. 

 
23.65.307  Moved structures 
Delete in its entirety. 
 
23.65.606  Structural 
Delete in its entirety. 
 
23.65.704.2 Automatic sprinkler systems 
Amend section 704.2.2 by deleting the reference to Group E occupancies. 

 
Add the following subsection: 
 

23.65.704.2.2.2 Group E Occupancy: When required by the International Fire 
Code, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all buildings 
containing a group E occupancy. 

 
23.65.705.4.4  Panic hardware 
Amend section 705.4.4 by changing the number 100 to 49. 

 
23.65.707  Structural 
Delete in its entirety. 
 
23.65.807  Structural 
Delete in its entirety. 
 
23.65.907  Structural 
Delete in its entirety 
 
23.65.1003  Structural 
Delete in its entirety 



Page 3 of 3 

 
23.65.1202.3  Wind loads 
In Exception 2, revise “5 percent” to read “10 percent”. 

 
23.65.1202.4  Seismic loads 
In Exception 2, revise “5 percent” to read “10 percent”. 
 
23.65.1202.5  Snow loads 
In the Exception, revise “5 percent” to read “10 percent”. 
 
23.65.1301.4.1  Structural analysis 
Add the following to the end of the sentence: 

“or shall comply to the structural provisions of chapter 3.” 
 

23.65  Appendix A 
Adopt Appendix A. 
 
 


